
CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 48-24, Citywide Vehicle Tint Services NOTE:  Highlighted Cell indicates a calculation correction.

DUE DATE: August 13, 2024; 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

Item Description  UOM Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

#100-2 Mid-size Sport Utility Vehicle (SUV)  each  $                                  375.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-3 Ford Maverick (4 door and rear window)  each  $                                  325.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-4 Ford F150 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  250.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  275.00  $                                  325.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 

#100-5 Ford 150 Extended Cab (2 door 2 1/2 doors rear window)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 

#100-6 Ford 150 Crew Cab (4 door and rear window)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-7 Ford F250 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  325.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-8 Ford F250 Extended Cab (2 door 2 1/2 doors rear window)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 

#100-9 Ford F250 Crew Cab (4 door and rear window)  each  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-10 Ford F350 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-11 Ford F350 Extended Cab (2 door 2 1/2 doors rear window)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 

#100-12 Ford F350 Crew Cab (4 door and rear window)  each  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-13 Ford F450 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-14 Ford F450 Extended Cab (2 door 2 1/2 doors rear window)  each  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  475.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 

#100-15 Ford F450 Crew Cab (4 door and rear window)  each  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  425.00  $                                  475.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-16 Ford F550 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  325.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-17 Ford F650 Regular Cab (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  325.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-18 Ford Transit T150 Van (2 front and 2 rear)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-19 Ford Transit T250 Van (2 front and 2 rear)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-20 Ford Transit T350 Van (2 front and 2 rear)  each  $                                  350.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  400.00  $                                  450.00  $                                  635.00  $                                  635.00 

#100-21 Ford Transit T150 Van (2 front)  each  $                                  275.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  260.00  $                                  260.00 

#100-22 Ford Transit T250 Van (2 front)  each  $                                  275.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  260.00  $                                  260.00 

#100-23 Ford Transit T350 Van (2 front)  each  $                                  275.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  260.00  $                                  260.00 
#100-24 Ford E450 Van (2 front)  each  $                                  200.00  $                                  225.00  $                                  200.00  $                                  250.00  $                                  260.00  $                                  260.00 
#100-25 Toyota Sienna  each  $                                  550.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  650.00  $                                  685.00  $                                  685.00 
#100-26 12-15 Passenger Van  each  $                               1,000.00  $                               1,050.00  $                               1,200.00  $                               1,275.00  $                                  770.00  $                                  770.00 
#100-27 CAT Loader/Backhoe (4 windows)  each  $                                  600.00  $                                  650.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  650.00  $                                  580.00  $                                  580.00 

#100-28 Front End Load/ Side Loader/ Rear End Load Refuse Truck (2 
windows)  each  $                                  275.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  375.00  $                                  375.00 

#100-29 Tractor (4 windows)  each  $                               1,000.00  $                               1,050.00  $                               1,150.00  $                               1,250.00  $                                  580.00  $                                  580.00 
John Deere AG  each  $                               2,000.00  $                               2,000.00  $                               2,000.00  $                               2,000.00  no bid  no bid 
John Deere 3032E  each  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00  no bid  no bid 
John Deere 5075m  each  $                               1,700.00  $                               1,700.00  $                               1,700.00  $                               1,700.00  no bid  no bid 

#100-30 Street Sweeper (2 door and rear window)  each  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  300.00  $                                  350.00  $                                  580.00  $                                  580.00 
#100-31 Windshield Strip  each  $                                    50.00  $                                    75.00  $                                    50.00  $                                    75.00  $                                  110.00  $                                  110.00 

 $                             15,600.00  $                             16,950.00  $                             16,475.00  $                             18,025.00  $                             16,610.00 16,610.00$                              

Item Description  UOM Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

Vendor Facility Services
Unit Price

Onsite Services
Unit Price

#200-1 Removal Services Front Window  each  $                                    30.00  $                                    40.00  $                                    35.00  $                                    55.00  $                                  170.00  $                                  170.00 
#200-2 Removal Services Rear Window  each  $                                    30.00  $                                    40.00  $                                    35.00  $                                    55.00  $                                  170.00  $                                  170.00 
#200-3 Removal Services 2 windows  each  $                                    60.00  $                                    80.00  $                                    60.00  $                                    80.00  $                                  110.00  $                                  110.00 
#200-4 Removal Services 4 windows  each  $                                  120.00  $                                  150.00  $                                  120.00  $                                  160.00  $                                  150.00  $                                  150.00 

240.00$                                   310.00$                                   250.00$                                   350.00$                                    $                                  600.00  $                                  600.00 Total: 

Category 100 - Installation - Price shall include materials, labor and installation 

Category 200 – Removal - Price shall be all inclusive (labor, materials, etc.)  

Total: 

Magicar Inc.

Magicar Inc. Sunproof Corp. Florida The BizzNizz LLC

Sunproof Corp. Florida The BizzNizz LLC
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