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BID TABULATION

 

Item No Description Estimated Annual 
Quantities UOM Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1.1 Cleary's 3336F, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 276.21$ 1,104.84$ 324.13$ 1,296.52$ 160.00$ 640.00$ 299.89$ 1,199.56$ 

1.2 Exterris, 2.5 Gallon 24 EA 366.00$ 8,784.00$ 366.00$ 8,784.00$ 366.00$ 8,784.00$ no bid no bid 366.00$ 8,784.00$ 

1.3 Caravan G 30 lb Bag Each 80 EA 71.50$ 5,720.00$ 52.11$ 4,168.80$ 58.12$ 4,649.60$ 68.00$ 5,440.00$ 58.46$ 4,676.80$ 

1.4 Eagle 20EW 64oz  Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 176.79$ 707.16$ no bid no bid 127.56$ 510.24$ 

1.5 Propiconazole 14.3 Generic Banner Maxx 1 Gallon Each 4 EA no bid no bid 119.54$ 478.16$ 255.00$ 1,020.00$ no bid no bid 67.46$ 269.84$ 

1.6 Headway G 30 lb Bag Each 30 EA 65.00$ 1,950.00$ 47.51$ 1,425.30$ 52.99$ 1,589.70$ 65.00$ 1,950.00$ 52.45$ 1,573.50$ 

1.7 Pillar G Intrinsic Fungicide 30 lb Each 30 EA 117.00$ 3,510.00$ 81.77$ 2,453.10$ 101.14$ 3,034.20$ 115.00$ 3,450.00$ 98.75$ 2,962.50$ 

1.8 T-Methyl ProtectMax 2.5 Gallon Each 2 EA 240.00$ 480.00$ no bid no bid 127.35$ 254.70$ 160.00$ 320.00$ 106.49$ 212.98$ 

1.9 T Methyl 2.08% Granlar 30 lb Bag Each 30 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 39.49$ 1,184.70$ 

1.11 Strobe, 30 lb Bag 2 EA 65.00$ 130.00$ 42.40$ 84.80$ 52.99$ 105.98$ no bid no bid 51.46$ 102.92$ 

1.12 Myclobutanil, 2.5 Gallon 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 176.79$ 353.58$ no bid no bid no bid no bid

1.13 Zerotol, 2.5 Gallon 2 EA no bid no bid 74.50$ 149.00$ 93.95$ 187.90$ no bid no bid 99.86$ 199.72$ 

2.1 Barricade 4FL, 1 Gallon Container Each 6 EA 166.50$ 999.00$ 166.50$ 999.00$ 166.50$ 999.00$ no bid no bid 166.50$ 999.00$ 

2.2 Celsius WG, 10 oz Bottle 130 EA 128.40$ 16,692.00$ 128.40$ 16,692.00$ 128.40$ 16,692.00$ no bid no bid 128.40$ 16,692.00$ 

2.3 Certainty, 1.3 oz Bottle 190 EA 95.00$ 18,050.00$ 71.22$ 13,531.80$ 97.85$ 18,591.50$ 68.00$ 12,920.00$ 86.46$ 16,427.40$ 

2.4 Daconil Weatherstik, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 1 EA 210.00$ 210.00$ 157.50$ 157.50$ 210.00$ 210.00$ no bid no bid 210.00$ 210.00$ 

2.5 Dismiss Turf Herb, 64 oz Bottle 6 EA 200.00$ 1,200.00$ 277.17$ 1,663.02$ 356.25$ 2,137.50$ 165.00$ 990.00$ 200.00$ 1,200.00$ 

2.6 Dismiss Southern Herb, 1 Pint Bottle 24 EA no bid no bid 142.90$ 3,429.60$ 165.03$ 3,960.72$ 145.00$ 3,480.00$ 196.86$ 4,724.64$ 

2.7 Droplet Landing Zone (DLZ), 2.5 Gallon bottle 20 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 124.88$ 2,797.60$ no bid no bid no bid no bid

2.8 Drive xlr8, .5 Gallon Container Each 5 EA no bid no bid 46.62$ 233.10$ 53.05$ 265.25$ 48.00$ 240.00$ 53.46$ 267.30$ 

2.9 Element 3A, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 119.58$ 478.32$ no bid no bid no bid no bid -$ -$ 

2.10 Element 4, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 148.25$ 593.00$ 253.59$ 1,014.36$ no bid no bid -$ -$ 

2.11 Fusilade II T&O, 1 qt Bottle 18 EA 98.00$ 1,764.00$ 76.63$ 1,379.34$ 85.47$ 1,538.46$ no bid no bid 92.46$ 1,664.28$ 

2.12 Garlon 3A, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 147.48$ 589.92$ no bid no bid no bid no bid 229.46$ 917.84$ 

2.13 Image 70 DG, 11.43 oz Bottle 8 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 169.93$ 1,359.44$ no bid no bid 159.46$ 1,275.68$ 

2.14 Kerb SC, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 6 EA no bid no bid 780.00$ 4,680.00$ 780.00$ 4,680.00$ 700.00$ 4,200.00$ 780.00$ 4,680.00$ 

2.15 MetSulfuron, 2 oz Bottle 10 EA no bid no bid 24.59$ 245.90$ 25.50$ 255.00$ 7.00$ 70.00$ 18.89$ 188.90$ 

2.16 Panoramic, 1 Gallon Container Each 20 EA no bid no bid 117.39$ 2,347.80$ 101.12$ 2,022.40$ no bid no bid 129.86$ 2,597.20$ 

2.17 Revolver, 87 oz. Bottle 10 EA 758.00$ 7,580.00$ 758.00$ 7,580.00$ 758.00$ 7,580.00$ no bid no bid 758.00$ 7,580.00$ 

2.18 Rodeo (Dow Agrosience), 2.5 Gallon Container Each 6 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 72.86$ 437.16$ 

2.19 Sedgehammer, 1.3 oz Bottle 16 EA 70.00$ 1,120.00$ 45.65$ 730.40$ 54.18$ 866.88$ 38.02$ 608.32$ 46.45$ 743.20$ 

2.20 Speedzone Southern (PBI Gordon), 2.5 Gallon container 8 EA 180.00$ 1,440.00$ 180.00$ 1,440.00$ 182.50$ 1,460.00$ no bid no bid 180.00$ 1,440.00$ 

2.21 Trimec Classic, 2.5 Gallon Container Each 6 EA no bid no bid 131.80$ 790.80$ 142.86$ 857.16$ no bid no bid 138.46$ 830.76$ 

2.22 Tribute, 6 oz Bottle 6 EA 413.60$ 2,481.60$ no bid no bid 413.60$ 2,481.60$ no bid no bid 413.60$ 2,481.60$ 

2.23 Tenactiy, 1 Gallon Container Each 7 EA 831.50$ 5,820.50$ 915.50$ 6,408.50$ 915.50$ 6,408.50$ 170.00$ 1,190.00$ 915.50$ 6,408.50$ 

2.24 Specticale FLO, 1 Gallon 4 EA 1,968.40$ 7,873.60$ 1,968.40$ 7,873.60$ 1,968.40$ 7,873.60$ no bid no bid 1,968.40$ 7,873.60$ 

2.25 Manuscript  With Adigor Adjuvant Pack (I Gallon.) 6 EA 970.00$ 5,820.00$ 970.00$ 5,820.00$ 970.00$ 5,820.00$ no bid no bid 970.00$ 5,820.00$ 

2.26 Lesco Methylated Seed Oil (MSO) 1 Gallon 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 60.00$ 240.00$ no bid no bid 37.60$ 150.40$ 

2.27 Lesco Three-Way Selective Post Emergent Liquid Herbicide  2.5 Gallon 43 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 66.05$ 2,840.15$ 85.00$ 3,655.00$ 63.46$ 2,728.78$ 

2.28 Lesco Tracker Max Spray Indicator Dye Blue 32 oz 26 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 19.56$ 508.56$ no bid no bid 18.76$ 487.76$ 

2.29 Lesco Triclopyr 4 Ester Post Emergent Liquid Herbicide 2.5 Gallon 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 253.59$ 507.18$ no bid no bid 158.94$ 317.88$ 

2.30 Lesco Quin-Way 1.5L Post Emergent Liquid Herbicide  64 oz 6 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 53.05$ 318.30$ 48.00$ 288.00$ 199.56$ 1,197.36$ 

2.31 Atrazine 4L Post Emergent Liquid Herbicide (RUP) 2.5 Gallon 2 EA 75.00$ 150.00$ no bid no bid 64.10$ 128.20$ no bid no bid 44.76$ 89.52$ 

2.32 Celsius Post Emergent Water Dispersible Granule Herbicide 10 oz. (Agency) 10 oz 30 EA 128.40$ 3,852.00$ 128.40$ 3,852.00$ 128.40$ 3,852.00$ no bid no bid 128.40$ 3,852.00$ 

2.33 Specticle Flo Pre Emergent Liquid Herbicide Agency) 18 oz 4 EA 315.60$ 1,262.40$ 315.60$ 1,262.40$ 315.60$ 1,262.40$ no bid no bid 315.60$ 1,262.40$ 

2.34 Tribute Total Non Selective Water Dispersible Granule Herbicide (Agency) 6 oz 6 EA 413.60$ 2,481.60$ 413.60$ 2,481.60$ 413.60$ 2,481.60$ no bid no bid 413.60$ 2,481.60$ 

2.35 Tribute Total WDG Post Emergent Herbicide (Agency) 6 oz 9 EA 413.60$ 3,722.40$ no bid no bid 413.60$ 3,722.40$ no bid no bid 413.60$ 3,722.40$ 

2.36 Primo Max 1 Gallon Container Each 1 EA 317.00$ 317.00$ 317.00$ 317.00$ 317.00$ 317.00$ 3,900.00$ 3,900.00$ 317.00$ 317.00$ 

2.37 Round up pro max 30 Gallon Drum Each  8 EA no bid no bid 658.74$ 5,269.92$ 1,081.61$ 8,652.88$ no bid no bid 1,009.98$ 8,079.84$ 

2.38 Cutless Growth regulator .33G  40 lb Bag Each 50 EA no bid no bid 250.40$ 12,520.00$ 309.68$ 15,484.00$ no bid no bid 276.86$ 13,843.00$ 
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2.39 Atrimmec PGR 1 Gallon Container 12 EA 387.00$ 4,644.00$ 387.00$ 4,644.00$ 403.00$ 4,836.00$ no bid no bid 387.00$ 4,644.00$ 

2.40 Plateau 1 Gallon Container Each 20 EA 185.00$ 3,700.00$ 135.92$ 2,718.40$ 148.87$ 2,977.40$ no bid no bid 139.86$ 2,797.20$ 

2.41 Dismiss Herbicide NXT 6oz Bottle 12 EA 105.20$ 1,262.40$ 64.57$ 774.84$ 490.00$ 5,880.00$ 40.00$ 480.00$ 92.00$ 1,104.00$ 

2.42 Prodiamine  4L Herbicide 2.5 Gallon container Each 8 EA no bid no bid 166.80$ 1,334.40$ 211.76$ 1,694.08$ no bid no bid 198.76$ 1,590.08$ 

2.43 Bassagran T&O 1 Gallon Each 12 EA 90.00$ 1,080.00$ 52.11$ 625.32$ 63.75$ 765.00$ no bid no bid 58.86$ 706.32$ 

2.44 Dimension  2 EW 2.5 Gallon Each 6 EA 613.00$ 3,678.00$ 613.00$ 3,678.00$ 613.00$ 3,678.00$ 525.00$ 3,150.00$ 613.00$ 3,678.00$ 

2.45 Quincloric, 1 lb. Bag 2 EA no bid no bid 39.08$ 78.16$ no bid no bid 55.00$ 110.00$ 49.89$ 99.78$ 

2.46 Lesco Tracker MAX Spray Indicator Dye Blue 2.5 Gallons 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 129.59$ 518.24$ no bid no bid 18.76$ 75.04$ 

2.47 Surepyc 1 Gallon. 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 93.00$ 372.00$ no bid no bid 387.00$ 1,548.00$ 

2.48 Princep 2.5 Gallon. 5 EA 93.00$ 465.00$ no bid no bid 74.06$ 370.30$ no bid no bid 74.86$ 374.30$ 

2.49 Diquat 1 Gallon. 4 EA no bid no bid 53.26$ 213.04$ 113.95$ 455.80$ no bid no bid 68.85$ 275.40$ 

2.50 Pennant Magnum 1 Gallon. 11 EA 300.00$ 3,300.00$ 230.91$ 2,540.01$ 251.68$ 2,768.48$ 265.00$ 2,915.00$ 258.86$ 2,847.46$ 

3.1 Top Choice, 50 lb Bag 40 EA 90.00$ 3,600.00$ -$ -$ 78.32$ 3,132.80$ 77.00$ 3,080.00$ 69.86$ 2,794.40$ 

3.2 Advion, Granular, 25 lb Bag 4 EA 105.00$ 420.00$ 70.11$ 280.44$ 76.79$ 307.16$ no bid no bid 84.47$ 337.88$ 

3.3 Bifen XTS Insecticide  1 Gallon 10 EA 175.00$ 1,750.00$ 122.88$ 1,228.80$ 141.48$ 1,414.80$ 160.00$ 1,600.00$ 123.27$ 1,232.70$ 

3.4 Triple Crown Turf and Ornamental Insecticide (Agency) 1 Gallon 9 EA 338.00$ 3,042.00$ 338.00$ 3,042.00$ 338.00$ 3,042.00$ no bid no bid 338.00$ 3,042.00$ 

3.5 Acephate 97UP, 10 lb Bag 6 EA 100.00$ 600.00$ -$ -$ 92.11$ 552.66$ 95.00$ 570.00$ 109.30$ 655.80$ 

3.6 Insecticide, Fire Ant, Amdro, 25lb Bag (65736) 60 EA 666.27$ 39,976.20$ 475.00$ 28,500.00$ 530.23$ 31,813.80$ no bid no bid 323.86$ 19,431.60$ 

3.7 Bait Station, Rats, 6/CS Package 6 EA no bid no bid 13.34$ 80.04$ 12.96$ 77.76$ no bid no bid no bid no bid

3.8 Aloft LC G Insecticide 30lb Bag Each 240 EA no bid no bid 58.54$ 14,049.60$ 69.00$ 16,560.00$ no bid no bid 69.00$ 16,560.00$ 

3.9 Aloft LC SC 64oz Container Each 6 EA no bid no bid 515.75$ 3,094.50$ 655.60$ 3,933.60$ no bid no bid 655.60$ 3,933.60$ 

3.10 Taurus Trio G Granular 30 lb Bag Each 60 EA 72.00$ 4,320.00$ 46.96$ 2,817.60$ 72.00$ 4,320.00$ no bid no bid 72.00$ 4,320.00$ 

3.11 Safari 20SG 3lb container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 293.46$ 1,173.84$ 397.20$ 1,588.80$ no bid no bid 397.20$ 1,588.80$ 

3.12 Dylox 6.2 Granular 30 lb Bag 62 EA 64.50$ 3,999.00$ 47.09$ 2,919.58$ 51.95$ 3,220.90$ 66.00$ 4,092.00$ 54.86$ 3,401.32$ 

3.13 Dylox 420 SL T&O  2.5 Gallon Container Each 4 EA no bid no bid 214.61$ 858.44$ 236.76$ 947.04$ 305.00$ 1,220.00$ 246.46$ 985.84$ 

3.14 Crosscheck 1 Gallon 2 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 42.25$ 84.50$ no bid no bid 35.68$ 71.36$ 

4.1 Lesco 21-0-0 water soluable 50 lb bag Each 120 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 25.41$ 3,049.20$ no bid no bid 18.00$ 2,160.00$ 

4.2 Lesco Palm & Tropical Ornamental Fertilizer 8-2-12 CRNPK Kieserite Micros L&O 50 lb. 120 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.26$ 3,511.20$ no bid no bid 32.55$ 3,906.00$ 

4.3 Lesco 18-0-10 Dimension .21% Plus Fertilizer 120 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 27.00$ 3,240.00$ no bid no bid 26.55$ 3,186.00$ 

4.4 Lesco 20-0-10 Atrazine 0.92% Plus Fertilizer 160 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 16.94$ 2,710.40$ no bid no bid 20.50$ 3,280.00$ 

4.5 Lesco 26-0-11 60% NosPlus 25% PolyPlus OPTI45 2Fe 1Mn 1Mn MOP 50 lb. 80 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.42$ 2,353.60$ 

4.6 Lesco Fertilizer 26-0-11 60% NOS 25% PolyPlus OPTI45 SOP 2Fe 1Mg 1Mn 50 lb. 80 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 29.42$ 2,353.60$ 

4.7 Lesco 18-0-10 ALLECTUS® 0.225 Insecticide Plus Fertilizer 80 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 28.16$ 2,252.80$ no bid no bid 26.40$ 2,112.00$ 

4.8 Lesco Fertilizer 13-0-0 Spar-TECH 6Fe 1Mn 2.5 Gallon 12 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 68.95$ 827.40$ 

4.9 Lesco Fertilizer Spar-TECH Micro Mix 2.5 Gallon 12 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 80.83$ 969.96$ 

4.10 Lesco Fertilizer Spar-Tech Bio Iron Plus 3Fe 0.75Mg 0.5Mn Humic / Kelp 2.5 Gallon.  12 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 79.74$ 956.88$ 

4.11 Sulfur Coated 0-0-38 2% Iron, 1% Manganese Fertilizer, Derived from Sulfur Coated 
Sulfate of Potash, Iron Sucrate, Manganese Oxide 50 lb Bag

200 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 43.04$ 8,608.00$ no bid no bid 41.50$ 8,300.00$ 

4.12
10-20-20 Fertilizer 25% SRN, 1% Magnesium, 1% Iron, Derived from Polymer Coated 
Urea, Ammonium Phosphate, Muriate of  Potash, Iron Sucrate, Sulfate of Potash 
Magnesium  50 lb Bag

360 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 19.32$ 6,955.20$ no bid no bid 19.95$ 7,182.00$ 

4.13 Dimension .25% Coated 18-0-10 50% SRN Fertilizer, Derived from Urea, Polymer Coated 
Urea, Muriate of Potash, 50 lb Bag

600 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 27.25$ 16,350.00$ 

4.14 Yara Turf Royale 21-7-14 - 50 lb. Bag 680 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 28.00$ 19,040.00$ no bid no bid 28.00$ 19,040.00$ 

4.15 YaraTropicote Fertilizer 15.5-0-0 Calc Nit  - 50 lb. Bag 40 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 15.75$ 630.00$ no bid no bid 16.50$ 660.00$ 

4.16 20-0-10 Fertilizer 50% SRN w/ 1% Ronstar Derived from Urea, Polymer Coated Urea, 
Sulfate of Potash,  50 lb. Bag

520 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 38.54$ 20,040.80$ no bid no bid 45.00$ 23,400.00$ 

4.17

15-2-8 Granular Fertilizer 75% SRN .55% CA, 2.25% MG, 10.74% Free S., 9.792% 
Combined, 05% FE., .04% MN., .04% ZN. Derived From Monoammonium Phosphate, 
Muriate of Potash, Polymer Coated Urea, Sulfate of Ammonium,  Calcium Sulfate, 
Elemental Sulfur, Ferrous Sulfate, Manganese Sulfate, Sulfate of Potash- Magnesia, Zinc 
Sulfate, 50 lb. Bag

520 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 18.24$ 9,484.80$ no bid no bid 21.85$ 11,362.00$ 

4.18 19-1-10 60% Polyon 44 REG. 50 lb. Bag 120 EA 21.75$ 2,610.00$ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 16.75$ 2,010.00$ 

4.19 Lesco Fertilizer elite 40% PolyPlus 14-2-14 2.4 FeSucrate 0.9% MgSucrate 2.2% 
MnSucrate. 50 lb. Bag 

50 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 18.59$ 929.50$ no bid no bid 42.89$ 2,144.50$ 

4.20 Lesco Granular Fertilizer 10-15-15 40% PolyPlus OPTI45 2% Fe 2% Mg 2% Mn - 50lb. 
Bag

6 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.70$ 130.20$ no bid no bid 25.00$ 150.00$ 

4.21 ProPlus Chelated Iron Fertilizer 12-0-0 2.5 Gallon. 90 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 22.00$ 1,980.00$ 

4.22 Allectus .225% Insecticide Plus Fertilizer 18-0-10 50% SRN. Derived From Polymer 
Coated Urea, Sulfate of Potash, Ammonium Sulfate  50 lb Bag

320 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 26.16$ 8,371.20$ no bid no bid 26.40$ 8,448.00$ 

Category 3 - Pesticides and Insecticides

Category 4 - Fertilizer



 

Item No Description Estimated Annual 
Quantities UOM Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Heritage Landscape Supply 
Group, Inc. dba Heritage 

Professional Products Group

Howard Fertilizer & Chemical 
LLC MAR Green Resources LLC SiteOne Landscape SupplyHarrell's, LLC

4.23 Lesco Fertilizer 18-24-12 25% PolyPlus OPTI45 - 50 lb.Bag 20 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.50$ 430.00$ 

4.24 Lesco 0-0-4 Spar-Tech 2.1Mg Fertilizer 2.5 Gallon. (QGCY) 4 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 57.79$ 231.16$ 

4.25 AMP XC Granular Enriched Gypsum - 50 lb. Bag 200 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 19.75$ 3,950.00$ 

4.26 Pelletized Gypsum - 50 lb. Bag 400 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 12.21$ 4,884.00$ no bid no bid 19.25$ 7,700.00$ 

4.27 Lesco Fertilizer 13-0-0 Spar Tech 6Fe 1Mn 2.5 Gallon. (QGCY) 20 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 68.95$ 1,379.00$ 

5.1 DeFoamer, 1 qt Bottle 36 EA 18.68$ 672.48$ 6.47$ 232.92$ 25.00$ 900.00$ no bid no bid 15.46$ 556.56$ 

5.2 Blue Dye Indicator, 2.5 Gallon Container 16 EA 100.00$ 1,600.00$ no bid no bid 129.56$ 2,072.96$ no bid no bid 43.86$ 701.76$ 

5.3 Nonionic Spreader Sticker, 1 Gallon Container 10 EA 38.00$ 380.00$ no bid no bid 47.62$ 476.20$ no bid no bid 13.86$ 138.60$ 

5.4 RRSI NIS Active Spreader/Sticker, 2.5 Gallon Container 32 EA 80.00$ 2,560.00$ no bid no bid 52.88$ 1,692.16$ no bid no bid no bid no bid

5.5 Methylated Seed Oil, 2.5 Gallon Container 6 EA 90.00$ 540.00$ no bid no bid 60.00$ 360.00$ no bid no bid 48.95$ 293.70$ 

5.6 Moisture Manager  2.5 Gallon 12 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 132.25$ 1,587.00$ no bid no bid 98.76$ 1,185.12$ 

5.7 Hydretain ES Plus Granular OC 40lbS Bag 40 EA no bid no bid 50.49$ 2,019.60$ 72.95$ 2,918.00$ 68.00$ 2,720.00$ 58.26$ 2,330.40$ 

5.8 Hydretain ES Plus II 2.5 Gallon 16 EA no bid no bid 95.38$ 1,526.08$ 132.25$ 2,116.00$ no bid no bid 98.76$ 1,580.16$ 

5.9 Nutra Sol Tank Cleaner 2 lb container 24 EA no bid no bid no bid no bid 15.16$ 363.84$ no bid no bid 9.18$ 220.32$ 

Item No. Description Percentage Amt

6.1 % off catalog for Category 1:  Fungicides

6.2 % off catalog for Category 2:  Herbicides

6.3 % off catalog for Category 3:  Pesticides and Insecticides

6.4 % off catalog for Category 4: Fertilizers   

6.5 % off catalog for Category 5: Related Products (Misc)

6.6 % off catalog for items not listed above

6.7 % off all inclusive pricing shall the City Pick up material from Vendor(s) facility (reference 
Detailed Specifications, 8. Material Pick-Up Specifications, page 17 of the solicitation)

Item No. Description Per acre rate

7.1 Application Chipco Choice Insecticide (Fipronil)- 80 acres estimated annual quanity

MAR Green Resources LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply

0% 0%

MAR Green Resources LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply

No Bid 103.00$                                                         

Category 7 - Insecticide with application
Delivery and application services will be needed on an as-needed basis, at various City locations

Harrell's, LLC

no bid 

Harrell's, LLC
Heritage Landscape Supply 

Group, Inc. dba Heritage 
Professional Products Group

Howard Fertilizer & Chemical 
LLC

Category 5 - Related Products (Misc.)

Category 6 - Catalog and Pick-up Discount

no bid no bid 

No  Bid No Bid 268.00$                                                         

Heritage Landscape Supply 
Group, Inc. dba Heritage 

Professional Products Group

Howard Fertilizer & Chemical 
LLC
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